
SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM   1 of 6 
West Ave. Elevated Storage Tank Painting and Rehabilitation Project - RFCSP | ADDENDUM 2 

WEST AVE. ELEVATED STORAGE TANK  
PAINTING AND REHABILITATION PROJECT 

SAWS Job No. 18-0110 
SAWS Solicitation No. B-20-017-SM 

ADDENDUM 2 
11/04/2020 

To Bidder of Record: 

This addendum, applicable to work referenced above, is an amendment to the bid proposal, plans and specifications and 
as such will be a part of and included in the Contract Documents. Acknowledge receipt of this addendum by entering the 
Addendum number and issue date on the space provided in submitted copies of the bid proposal.   

RESPONSES TO QUESTIONS 

1. We are requesting that the exterior coatings system for Sherwin Williams and Carboline be modified to allow
for the following.  The reason for this is because the specified coatings have very short recoat windows so they
will require a complete sanding in between coats.
a. Carboline – Primer and intermediate to be Carboguard 60
b. Sherwin Williams – Primer and intermediate to be Macropoxy 646 FC

Response:  Specification Section 09871 2.01B tables will be updated to allow for the coating systems to be 
permissible on this project.  See “Changes to the Specifications” section of this addendum. 

2. Specification Section 09872-4 3.03 A. Final Coat – the specification reads Once the entire interior surfaces have
been blasted, the CONTRACTOR shall then pressure wash the interior to remove all residual blasting dust and
debris prior to the finish coat. Please advise if this is a mistake as it is not recommended to pressure wash after
the steel has been blasted.

Response: Specification Section 09872-4 3.03 A. The Final Coat application procedure will be modified to remove
the requirement to pressure wash the interior to remove all residual blasting dust and debris prior to the finish
coat. The interior must be cleaned per project specifications and SSPC standards.  See “Changes to the
Specifications” section of this addendum.

3. Sheet S-106 of the drawings – The note says to seal weld joint between perimeter plates (typ around perimeter).
Is the intent to only weld the horizontal seam at the elevation shown in the drawings or are we to include
welding the perimeter of all horizontal seams at all levels of the bowl?

Response: The intent is to seal weld the entire horizontal seam.

4. Specification 13200 Section 3.01 I – states to replace the existing roof vent with a 20” and the drawings show a
24”. Please clarify.

Response: Specification Section 13200 will be updated to state the vent diameter to be 24”.  See “Changes to the
Specifications” section of this addendum.



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM   2 of 6 
West Ave. Elevated Storage Tank Painting and Rehabilitation Project - RFCSP | ADDENDUM 2 

5. Specification 13200 Section 3.01 S - Overflow improvements states to replace the existing flap valve with an 8” 
tideflex duck bill type while the drawings on sheet D-102 states to replace with a Waterman flap valve. 
 
Response: Specification Section 13200 will be updated to state the overflow valve will be replaced with a 
Waterman Flap Valve.  See “Changes to the Specifications” section of this addendum. 
 

6. Specification 13200 Section 3.01 S – Overflow improvements states to install a concrete splash pad with walls 
under the overflow pipe and install a concrete channel from splash pad to route overflow from the site as 
shown in the Contract Documents.  There are no references to this on the drawings.   

 
Response: Specification Section 13200 will be updated to remove the requirement to install a concrete splash 
pad and channel.  See “Changes to the Specifications” section of this addendum. 
 

 
 

 
CHANGES TO THE SPECIFICATIONS 

 
1. Instructions to Respondents 

a. Sections 1(a-e), 2 a, and 4:   DELETE in their entirety and REPLACE with the following: 
 

 “1.  Proposals will be submitted in accordance with the following: 
 

a. Three (3) separate files in pdf format, as indicated on the Respondent’s Proposal 
Checklist, clearly titled, signed in blue ink uploaded to the FTP site provided by 
SAWS until the time specified in the RFCSP. 

 
b. All sealed proposals errantly submitted or delivered to a location other than the 

exact location stated above may be returned unopened. 
 

c. Electronic proposals will be received by Contract Administration in the SAWS 
secured File Transfer Protocol (FTP) site.  All proposals will be received until the 
date and time specified in the Request for Competitive Sealed Proposals. 

 
d. All electronic or sealed proposals received after the exact time set for the proposal 

opening in the Request for Competitive Sealed Proposals will be returned/ deleted 
and unopened. 

 
e. The San Antonio Water System Contracting Office may, at its sole discretion, 

without waiver of rights or authority, in equity or at law, return or delete any 
unopened proposals not meeting the exact requirements as stated above.” 

 
  “2.  Proposals will be opened in accordance with the following: 

 
a. Proposals will be opened in a public WebEx meeting and the names of the offerors 

and all prices stated on each price proposal will be read aloud by a Contract 
Administration representative. Instructions on how to participate in this public 
WebEx meeting can be found in the Electronic Proposal Opening Instructions.” 

 
            All other language in this section remains the same. 
 

“4. Electronic proposals must be submitted with the original price proposal form attached herein 
and shall be submitted through the SAWS FTP site and shall be titled as indicated in the 
Respondent Proposal Checklist.” 

2. Supplementary Instructions to Respondents 
a. Section F (1-9) shall be DELETED and REPLACED with the following: 
 



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM   3 of 6 
West Ave. Elevated Storage Tank Painting and Rehabilitation Project - RFCSP | ADDENDUM 2 

“F.   FORMAT OF PROPOSALS   
 

1. Proposals shall be prepared simply and economically, providing a straightforward, 
concise description of the Respondent's ability to meet the requirements of this 
RFCSP. Emphasis shall be (in no particular order) on the quality, completeness, clarity 
of content, responsiveness to the requirements, responsiveness to the evaluation 
criteria, and an understanding of SAWS needs. 

 
2. Respondents shall utilize the fillable evaluation forms provided by SAWS to prepare 

the response to this RFCSP and should reference the Required Documents Matrix, 
which identifies which documents are required and won’t count towards the page 
limit. The cover, cover letter (if any), table of contents, divider sheets, proposal 
checklist, financial statement, Evaluation Criteria Forms, Good Faith Effort Plan, Price 
Proposal, and any other required documents will not count as printed pages. 
Proposals shall be a maximum of 25 pages, for those pages that do not count 
towards the page limit. Respondents shall respond to each section fully, but are not 
obligated to use every page set by the limit and are allowed the flexibility to use this 
page limit as they see fit. 

 
3. Proposals shall be submitted in three (3) pdf files electronically. Respondents 

should reference the revised Respondent’s Proposal Checklist to ensure all 
required items are included. 

 
4. Respondents shall carefully read the information contained in this RFCSP and submit 

a complete response to all requirements and questions as directed. Incomplete 
Proposals may be considered non-responsive and subject to rejection. 

 
5. Proposals and any other information submitted by Respondents in response to this 

RFCSP shall become the property of SAWS. 
 

6. Proposals shall be prepared on letter-size 8-1/2” x 11” paper and assembled with 
spiral-type bindings or staples. The project schedule can be printed using tabloid-size 
11” x 17” paper.  

 
7. Respondents shall utilize the Respondent’s Proposal Checklist provided in this RFCSP 

and must provide page numbers for all pages of the proposal. 
 

8. Separate and identify each evaluation criteria response of this RFCSP by use of a 
divider sheet for ready reference in the order indicated within the Respondent’s 
Proposal Checklist. 

 
9. The pdf of the Respondent’s Original proposal shall contain the entire proposal 

package as submitted, excluding the financial statement, Good Faith Effort Plan, and 
Price Proposal.” 

 
              All other language in the remainder of the Supplementary Instructions to Respondents            

remains the same. 
3. Respondent Proposal Checklist 

a. DELETE in its entirety and REPLACE with the version attached to this Addendum. Respondents shall 
use this version when submitting a proposal for this project. 

4. Supplemental Conditions 
a. Page SS-3; Article V-Contract Responsibilities:  DELETE the Rigger’s Liability coverage, which is not 

required. The remainder of this section shall remain unchanged. 
b. Page SS-4; Article VIII – Contract Completion Time:  Liquidated Damages amount - DELETE “$1,890.00 

per day” and REPLACE with “$1,170 per day”. 
5. Section 01010 Summary of Work 



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM   4 of 6 
West Ave. Elevated Storage Tank Painting and Rehabilitation Project - RFCSP | ADDENDUM 2 

a. Paragraph 1.04.L.:  DELETE “Section 09900 – General Specifications for Coating Systems.” and 
REPLACE with “Section 09910 – Tank Painting and Coating.” in both occurrences. 

6. Section 01310 Construction Progress Schedule 
a. Paragraph 1.02.D.:  DELETE in its entirety. 
b. Paragraph 1.03.A.2.:  DELETE “Section 1301 “Contractor’s Submittals”” and REPLACE with “Section 

1300 Submittals”. 
7. Section 01430 Operation and Maintenance Data 

a. Paragraph 1.04.B.:  DELETE “optical compact disk” and REPLACE with “flash drive.” 
b. Paragraph 1.05.A.1.:  DELETE “three copies” and REPLACE with “one electronic copy”. 
c. Paragraph 1.05.A.3.a & b.:  DELETE lines “a. and b.” in their entirety. 
d. Paragraph 1.05.A.3.c.:  DELETE line “c.” in its entirety and REPLACE with “a.  Submit one hard 

copy and one electronic copy of Final Manual.”. 
e. Paragraph 1.05.A.4.a. & b.:  DELETE lines “a. and b.” in their entirety.   
f. Paragraph 1.05.A.4.c.:  DELETE line “c.” in its entirety and REPLACE with “a.  Resubmit 

one hard copy and one electronic copy of the revised Preliminary copy for Owner's review.”. 
8. ADD Section 01640 Manufacturer’s Field Services in its entirety and to the Table of Contents. Specification is 

attached to the end of the Addendum. 
9. Section 01752 Facility Startup and Commissioning Requirements 

a. Paragraph 1.02.A.:  DELETE “Section 01301 – Contractor’s Submittals” and REPLACE with “Section 
01300 – Submittals”. 

10. Section 03301 EST Cast in Place Concrete 
a. Paragraph 2.7.A.:  DELETE “09900, Painting and Coating” and REPLACE with “09910 – Tank Painting 

and Coating”. 
11. Section 03610 Grout 

a. Paragraph 1.03.A.:  DELETE “1-year” and REPLACE with “2-year”.  
12. Section 05121 EST Structural Steel Framing 

a. Paragraph 2.3.A.:  DELETE “09900 “General Specification for Coating Systems”.” and REPLACE with 
“09910 “Tank Painting and Coating”.” 

b. Paragraph 2.6.B.:   DELETE “09900 “General Specification for Coating Systems”.” and REPLACE with 
“09910 “Tank Painting and Coating”.” 

c. Paragraph 3.6.C.:   DELETE “09900 “General Specification for Coating Systems”.” and REPLACE with 
“09910 “Tank Painting and Coating”.” 

d. END OF SECTION notation:  DELETE “05120” and REPLACE with “05121”. 
13. Section 09871 Exterior Coating System for Steel Storage Tanks 

a. Paragraph 2.01B: Tables will be updated to allow for the coating systems below to be permissible on 
this project:  
Carboline –DELETE “Carboguard 890” and REPLACE with “Carboguard 60” for both Primer Coat and 
Stripe Coat. 
Sherwin Williams – DELETE “Macropoxy 267 MIO” and REPLACE with “Macropoxy 646 FC” for Prime 
Coat. 

14. Section 09872 Interior Coating System for Steel Storage Tanks 
a. Paragraph 1.03.A.: DELETE “01301 – Contractor’s Submittals” and REPLACE with “01300 – 

Submittals”. 
b. Paragraph 3.03 A: DELETE the following sentence in its entirety, “Once the entire interior surfaces 

have been blasted, the CONTRACTOR shall then pressure wash the interior to remove all residual 
blasting dust and debris prior to the finish coat”. 

15. Section 09910 Tank Painting and Coating 
a. Paragraph 1.07.A.: DELETE “to Article V Section 5.19 of”.  

16. Section 13110 Cathodic Protection System 
a. Paragraph 3.03.A.:  DELETE “warranty” and REPLACE with “one (1) year anniversary”. 
b. Title of paragraph 3.05:  DELETE “GUARANTEE” and REPLACE with “WARRANTY”. 
c. Paragraph 3.05.A.:  DELETE “guarantee” and REPLACE with “have a warranty”. 
d. Paragraph 3.06.A.:  DELETE “warranty” and REPLACE with “two (2) year warranty”. 

17. Section 13200 Steel Water Storage Tank Rehabilitation 
a. Paragraph 2.01.C.:  DELETE in its entirety.  
b. Paragraph 3.01.I.:  DELETE “20-inch” and REPLACE with “24-inch”. 



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM   5 of 6 
West Ave. Elevated Storage Tank Painting and Rehabilitation Project - RFCSP | ADDENDUM 2 

c. Paragraph 3.01.R.:  DELETE “Section 09900” and REPLACE with “Section 09910”.  
d. Paragraph 3.01.S.:  DELETE “Tideflex duck-bill type” and REPLACE with “Waterman flap”. 
e. Paragraph 3.01.S.:  DELETE final sentence “CONTRACTOR to install a concrete splash pad with walls 

under the overflow pipe and install a concrete channel from splash pad to route overflow from the 
site as shown in the Contract Documents.”. 

18. Section 16010 Basic Electrical Requirements 
a. Paragraph 1.03.B.10.:  ADD “within 3-inches of accuracy” to end of sentence.  
b. Paragraph 1.03.B.13.:  DELETE “01301 Contractor’s Submittals” and REPLACE with “01430 Operation 

and Maintenance Data”. 
c. Paragraph 1.04.A.:  DELETE “01301, Contractor’s Submittals” and REPLACE with “01300, Submittals”. 
d. Paragraph 1.04.A.:  DELETE “Section 5.13” and REPLACE with “Section 5.12”. 

19. Section 16950 Electrical Testing 
a. Paragraph 3.01.A.:  DELETE “01751, STARTING OF SYSTEMS” and REPLACE with “01752 Facility Start 

up and Commissioning Requirements”.   
 
 

CHANGES TO THE PLANS 
 

1. None 
 
 

CLARIFICATIONS 
 

1. None 
  



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM   6 of 6 
West Ave. Elevated Storage Tank Painting and Rehabilitation Project - RFCSP | ADDENDUM 2 

END OF ADDENDUM 

This Addendum, including these six (6) pages, is fourteen (14) pages with attachments in its entirety. 

Attachments. 
Respondent’s Proposal Checklist (1 page) 
Manufacturer’s Field Services (7 pages) 

_____________________________________ 
Don Burger, P.E. 

Tetra Tech 



Rev. 3/5/2020 
CH-1 

RESPONDENT’S PROPOSAL CHECKLIST  

Project Name:   W-1 Leon Creek: Hwy 151 to Hwy 90 - Upper Segment    
SAWS Job No.  19-4528 
SAWS Solicitation Number:  CO-00351 

FILE 1 
Titled: PROPOSAL_CO00351_FIRM NAME 

  Signed Price Proposal/Acknowledgement of Addenda (BP-1) 
  General Price Proposal Items (latest versions)  
 Signed Proposal Certification Page (PC-1) 

  Bid Bond* 
  Financial Statement  

*If proposal is submitted electronically without Bid Bond, SAWS will require check within 24 hour of bid opening
  Cashier’s Check or Certified Check  

FILE 2 
Titled: ORIGINAL PROPOSAL_CO00351_FIRM NAME 

  Proposal Checklist 
  Statement on President’s Executive Orders – Page IR - 8 
  Good Faith Effort Plan   
  Conflict of Interest Questionnaire – Form CIQ (Rev. 11/30/2015) 
W-9
Proof of Insurability (Letter from Insurer or Sample Certificate of Insurance)
Respondent Questionnaire
Evaluation Criteria Form

  Team Qualifications and Experience with Resumes and Organizational Chart 
  Quality, Reputation, and Ability to Deliver Projects on Schedule and within Budget 
  Project Approach including Delivery Schedule 
  Safety Information for Prime Contractor and Key Subcontractor(s) 

FILE 3 
Titled: COPY_CO00351_FIRM NAME 

(Excludes Price Proposal and Financial Statement) 

  Proposal Checklist 
  Respondent Questionnaire   
  Evaluation Criteria Form 

  Team Qualifications and Experience with Resumes and Organizational Chart 
  Quality, Reputation, and Ability to Deliver Projects on Schedule and within Budget 
  Project Approach including Delivery Schedule  
  Safety Information for Prime Contractor and Key Subcontractor(s) 

I certify that the proposal packet submitted includes the items as indicated above. 

Signature Date 

Printed Name 

Title 

Firm Name 

Project Name:  West Ave. Elevated Storage Tank Painting and Rehabilitation Project 
SAWS Job No.  ____ 18‐0110___________________________________   
SAWS Solicitation Number: __B‐20‐008‐SM   __________________ B-20-017-SM

Titled: PROPOSAL_ B-20-017-SM_FIRM NAME

Titled: ORIGINAL PROPOSAL_ B-20-017-SM_FIRM NAME

Titled: COPY_ B-20-017-SM_FIRM NAME

Addendum 2

FILE 2



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM  WEST AVE. EST REHABILITATION AND PAINTING 

MANUFACTURER’S FIELD SERVICES                                      BID SET 10/2020 – ADDENDUM 2 

01640- 1 

 

 

SECTION 01640 

 

MANUFACTURER’S FIELD SERVICES 

 

PART 1 GENERAL  

 

1.01  SCOPE 

 

A. This section shall govern the requirements established for manufacturer's field services associated 

with the installation of equipment.  

 

1.02  RELATED WORK  

 

A. Section 01301, Contractor’s Submittals  

B. Section 01620, Equipment Schedule  

 

1.03  DESCRIPTION OF WORK  

 

A. CONTRACTOR shall arrange for and coordinate the manufacturer's services as specified below.  

 

1.04  SUBMITTALS  

 

A. Training Plan (Pre Start Up and Post Start Up):  

 

 1. Submit not less than 21 calendar days prior to start of equipment testing and revise as       

     necessary for OWNER’s acceptance. 

  

 2. Submit MANUFACTURER’s tentative training schedule, training plan, and contact person not 

     less than 60 days prior to commencement of any training.  

 

  a. MANUFACTURER’s proposed Training Plan shall include the elements presented in  

      the Outline of Instruction Training Plan specified herein. Specific components and  

      procedures shall be identified in the proposed Training Plan. Hands-on demonstrations   

      planned for the instruction shall be described in the Training Plan. The    

      MANUFACTURER shall indicate the estimated duration of each segment of the  

      Training Plan. 

   (i)  Outline of Instruction Plan:  

1. Equipment Description and Purpose 

2. Equipment operation 

3. Detailed component description 

4. Equipment preventative maintenance (PM) 

5. Equipment troubleshooting 

6. Equipment corrective maintenance 

 

 3. Provide complete training materials, to include operation and maintenance data as required in    

     this section to be retained by each trainee.  

 

  



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM  WEST AVE. EST REHABILITATION AND PAINTING 

MANUFACTURER’S FIELD SERVICES                                      BID SET 10/2020 – ADDENDUM 2 

01640- 2 

 

B. Quality Control Submittals:  

 

 1. MANUFACTURER's Certificate of Proper Installation:  

 

  a. When specified in the individual Equipment Specifications sections or Equipment  

      Schedule, submit certificate certifying:  

(i) The product or system has been installed in accordance with the 

MANUFACTURER's recommendations, inspected by a 

MANUFACTURER's authorized representative, and serviced with the 

proper lubricants.  

 

(ii) Necessary safety equipment has been properly installed.  

 

(iii) Electrical and mechanical connections have been made meeting quality and 

safety standards and as required.  

   

(iv) Free from undue stress imposed by exterior connections or loads.  

    

(v) Proper adjustments have been made and the product or system is ready for 

testing, facilities startup, operational test, and operation.  

 

  b. Submit MANUFACTURER’s Certified of Proper Installation Form at the end of this  

      specification.  

  

2. Certificate of Successful Equipment Testing: Prepare and submit where specified in individual 

Equipment specification sections or Equipment Schedule, and upon completion of successful 

testing of respective equipment by the CONTRACTOR. See Certificate of Successful 

Equipment Testing Form at end of this specification.  

 

 3. Certificate of Successful Equipment System, Subsystem or Component, Start Up Testing    

     including Functional and Performance Tests: Prepare and submit where specified in individual  

     equipment specification sections or Equipment Schedule, and upon completion of successful      

     Start Up testing of respective equipment system, subsystem or component by the       

     CONTRACTOR. See Certificate of Successful Equipment System, Subsystem or Component   

     Start Up Testing Form at the end of this specification.   

 

1.05  QUALIFICATION OF MANUFACTURER'S REPRESENTATIVE 

 

A. Authorized representative of the MANUFACTURER, Certified by MANUFACTURER, factory 

trained, and experienced in the technical applications, installation, operation, and maintenance of 

respective equipment, subsystem, or component. Representative subject to acceptance by 

OWNER. No substitute representatives will be allowed unless prior written approval by OWNER 

has been given. 

  

1.06  FULFILLMENT OF SPECIFIED MINIMUM SERVICES  

 

A. Where manufacturers' services are specified, furnish MANUFACTURER’s representative 

qualified to provide these services. Where time is necessary in excess of that stated in the 



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM  WEST AVE. EST REHABILITATION AND PAINTING 

MANUFACTURER’S FIELD SERVICES                                      BID SET 10/2020 – ADDENDUM 2 

01640- 3 

 

Contract Documents for MANUFACTURER’ Specifications for manufacturers' services, 

additional time required to perform the specified services shall be considered incidental work.  

 

B. Coordinate and Schedule MANUFACTURER's field services to avoid conflicting with other field 

testing or other manufacturer's field services. Determine that all conditions necessary to allow 

successful testing have been met before scheduling field services.  

 

C. Only those days of service approved by OWNER will be credited to fulfill the specified minimum 

services.  

 

D. If specified, MANUFACTURER's services shall include as a minimum:  

 

 1. Assistance during installation to include observation, guidance, instruction of                                    

     CONTRACTOR'S assembly, erection, installation or application procedures.  

 

 2. Inspection, checking, and adjustment as required for equipment to function as warranted by  

     manufacturer and necessary to provide written approval of installation.  

 

 3. Revisiting the site as required to correct problems and until installation and operation are    

     acceptable to OWNER.  

 

 4. Resolution of assembly or installation problems attributable to, or associated with, respective     

     MANUFACTURER's products and systems.  

 

 5. Assistance during testing and Start Up demonstration, and until product acceptance by the   

     OWNER. 

  

 6. Training of OWNER'S personnel in the operation and maintenance of respective product as   

     required herein.  

 

 7. Completion of Manufacturer's Certificate of Proper Installation and applicable certificates of    

     Successful Equipment Testing and Successful Equipment System, Subsystem or Component   

     Start Up Testing, as required, including functional and performance tests service. (Forms   

     enclosed at end of this specification)  

 

1.07  TRAINING SCHEDULE  

 

A. List specified equipment, system, subsystem and component with respective 

MANUFACTURERs that require training services of MANUFACTURER's representatives and 

show:  

 

 1. Estimated dates for installation completion.  

 

 2. Estimate training dates to allow for multiple sessions when several shifts are involved.  

 

 3. Use Equipment Schedule as guidance and revise as needed to meet individual equipment   

     specification or MANUFACTURER’s requirements for the preparation of estimated dates.   

     Dates must be included as milestones on general project schedule, and must be coordinated as   

     to allow completion of the project including Start Up Phase by Substantial Completion Date.  

 



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM  WEST AVE. EST REHABILITATION AND PAINTING 

MANUFACTURER’S FIELD SERVICES                                      BID SET 10/2020 – ADDENDUM 2 

01640- 4 

 

B. Adjust training schedule to allow full participation of appropriate OWNER and 

MANUFACTURER personnel at times of day specified by OWNER. Adjust schedule for 

interruptions in operability of equipment.  

 

1.08  TRAINING OWNER'S PERSONNEL  

 

A. Provide trained, articulate personnel acceptable to the OWNER to coordinate and expedite 

training, to be present during training coordination meetings with OWNER and familiar with 

operation and maintenance manual information.  

 

B. MANUFACTURER's representatives shall provide the number of days of training for equipment 

as indicated in the Equipment Schedule section. Operator training days shall be in addition to 

MANUFACTURER’s field services required as indicated in the Equipment Schedule and 

submittals section.  

 

 1. All training will be performed during the operating staff’s normal business hours and at other   

     times requested and approved by the OWNER.  

  

C. MANUFACTURER’s representative to provide detailed training to OWNER’s personnel on 

operation and maintenance of specified product (equipment, system, subsystem, component) and 

as required in applicable Contract Documents. This includes operation disassembly, and assembly 

of major equipment items, Start Up, shutdown, safety concerns, troubleshooting, installation, 

alignment, and recommended corrective and preventative maintenance procedures for all 

equipment.   

 

 1. Training services include Pre Start Up classroom instruction and Post Start Up onsite hands-on   

     instruction.  

 

 2. MANUFACTURER’s Representative shall be familiar with system operation and maintenance 

     requirements for specified equipment, system, subsystem or component.  

 

D. Taping of Training Sessions: MANUFACTURER right to videotape  Pre Start and Post Start Up 

training sessions and furnish to the OWNER.  

 

PART 2 PRODUCTS (NOT USED)  

PART 3 EXECUTION (NOT USED)  

 

END OF SECTION 



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM  WEST AVE. EST REHABILITATION AND PAINTING 

MANUFACTURER’S FIELD SERVICES                                      BID SET 10/2020 – ADDENDUM 2 

01640- 5 

 

MANUFACTURER'S CERTIFICATE OF PROPER INSTALLATION 

 

 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM    EQPT SERIAL NO.:___________________  

EQPT TAG NO.:__________________________ EQPT/SYSTEM:______________________  

PROJECT NO.:___________________________  SPEC. SECTION:_____________________  

 

I hereby certify that the above-referenced equipment/system has been:  

 

 (Check Applicable)  

 

   Installed in accordance with Manufacturer's recommendations.  

 

   Inspected, checked, and adjusted.  

 

   Serviced with proper initial lubricants.  

 

   Electrical and mechanical connections meet quality and safety standards.  

 

   All applicable safety equipment has been properly installed.  

 

   System has been performance tested, and meets or exceeds specified  

      performance requirements. (When complete system of one manufacturer.  

 

Comments:___________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________ 

  

I, the undersigned Manufacturer's Representative, hereby certify that I am (I) a duly authorized 

representative of the manufacturer, (ii) empowered by the manufacturer to inspect, approve, and operate 

his equipment and (iii) authorized to make recommendations required to assure that the equipment 

furnished by the manufacturer is complete and operational, except as may be otherwise indicated herein. I 

further certify that all information contained herein is true and accurate. 

  

Date: ____________________________, 20___  

 

Manufacturer:_________________________________________________________________  

 

By Manufacturer's Authorized Representative:_______________________________________  

             (Print Name/Authorized Signature)  



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM  WEST AVE. EST REHABILITATION AND PAINTING 

MANUFACTURER’S FIELD SERVICES                                      BID SET 10/2020 – ADDENDUM 2 

01640- 6 

 

CERTIFICATE OF SUCCESSFUL EQUIPMENT TESTING 

 

 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM    EQPT SERIAL NO.:___________________  

EQPT TAG NO.:__________________________  EQPT/SYSTEM:______________________  

PROJECT NO.:___________________________  SPEC. SECTION:_____________________  

 

I hereby certify that the above-referenced equipment/system has been:  

 

 (Check Applicable)  

  

   Serviced for proper operation, efficiency, and capacity.  

 

   Tested continuously under actual or simulated operation conditions.  

 

   Tested over the full range of speed and pressure.  

 

   Tested at every level of control.  

 

Comments:___________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________ 

  

I, the undersigned Contractor's Representative, hereby certify that I am (I) a duly authorized 

representative of the manufacturer, (ii) empowered by the manufacturer to inspect, approve, and operate 

his equipment and (iii) authorized to make recommendations required to assure that the equipment 

furnished by the manufacturer is complete and operational, except as may be otherwise indicated herein. I 

further certify that all information contained herein is true and accurate.  

 

Date: ____________________________, 20___  

 

Contractor:_________________________________________________________________  

 

By Manufacturer/Supplier Authorized Representative:_______________________________________  

              (Print Name/Authorized Signature)  

 

By Contractor’s Authorized Representative:_______________________________________  

        (Print Name/Authorized Signature)  



SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM  WEST AVE. EST REHABILITATION AND PAINTING 

MANUFACTURER’S FIELD SERVICES                                      BID SET 10/2020 – ADDENDUM 2 

01640- 7 

 

CERTIFICATE OF SUCCESSFUL EQUIPMENT SYSTEM, SUBSYSTEM OR COMPONENT 

START UP TESTING 

 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM    EQPT SERIAL NO.:___________________  

EQPT TAG NO.:__________________________  EQPT/SYSTEM:______________________  

PROJECT NO.:___________________________  SPEC. SECTION:_____________________  

 

I hereby certify that the above-referenced equipment/system has been:  

 (Check Applicable)  

  

   Demonstrate all operational features, instrumentation, and control functions while in  

      automatic mode.  

 

   Checked for proper installation, started and successfully tested.  

 

   System has been functionally tested, and meets or exceeds specified performance  

      requirements. (When complete system of one manufacturer.)  

 

   System has been performance tested, and meets or exceeds specified performance  

      requirements. (When complete system of one manufacturer.)  

 

   Facility is ready for intended operation.  

 

Comments:___________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________

_____________________________________________________________________________________ 

  

I, the undersigned Contractor's Representative, hereby certify that I am (I) a duly authorized 

representative of the manufacturer, (ii) empowered by the manufacturer to inspect, approve, and operate 

his equipment and (iii) authorized to make recommendations required to assure that the equipment 

furnished by the manufacturer is complete and operational, except as may be otherwise indicated herein. I 

further certify that all information contained herein is true and accurate.  

 

Date: ____________________________, 20___  

 

Contractor:_________________________________________________________________  

 

By Manufacturer/Supplier Authorized Representative:_______________________________________  

              (Print Name/Authorized Signature)  

By Contractor’s Authorized Representative:_______________________________________  

         (Print Name/Authorized Signature) 


